

Lot A: KMC Controls Certified

#	Personnel Classification	WF	WW Gay Mechanical Contractors, Inc.		Automated Controls, LLC	
			Hourly Service Rate	Weighted HR	Hourly Service Rate	Weighted HR
1	HVAC Control System Service Technician (Manufacturer Certification Required) (assigned alone or additional to Crew)	65.0%				
a.	"Straight Time", M-F, 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.	62.0%	\$ 104.00	\$ 64.48	NB	
b.	"Premium Time", M-F, 5:01 p.m. to 6:59 a.m.; Weekends and Holidays	3.0%	\$ 130.00	\$ 3.90	NB	
2	Electrical Technician w/Limited Energy Contractor License (assigned alone or additional to Crew)	25.0%				
a.	"Straight Time", M-F, 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.	22.0%	\$ 104.00	\$ 22.88	NB	
b.	"Premium Time", M-F, 5:01 p.m. to 6:59 a.m.; Weekends and Holidays	3.0%	\$ 130.00	\$ 3.90	NB	
3	Trades Helper (assigned as addition to Crew)	10.0%				
a.	"Straight Time", M-F, 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.	9.0%	\$ 46.00	\$ 4.14	NB	
b.	"Premium Time", M-F, 5:01 p.m. to 6:59 a.m.; Weekends and Holidays	1.0%	\$ 60.00	\$ 0.60	NB	
AWARD TOTAL:			\$ 99.90		NO BID	

Lot B: Honeywell Controls Certified

#	Personnel Classification	WF	WW Gay Mechanical Contractors, Inc.		Automated Controls, LLC	
			Hourly Service Rate	Weighted HR	Hourly Service Rate	Weighted HR
1	HVAC Control System Service Technician (Manufacturer Certification Required) (assigned alone or additional to Crew)	65.0%				
a.	"Straight Time", M-F, 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.	62.0%	\$ 104.00	\$ 64.48	NB	
b.	"Premium Time", M-F, 5:01 p.m. to 6:59 a.m.; Weekends and Holidays	3.0%	\$ 130.00	\$ 3.90	NB	
2	Electrical Technician w/Limited Energy Contractor License (assigned alone or additional to Crew)	25.0%				
a.	"Straight Time", M-F, 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.	22.0%	\$ 104.00	\$ 22.88	NB	
b.	"Premium Time", M-F, 5:01 p.m. to 6:59 a.m.; Weekends and Holidays	3.0%	\$ 130.00	\$ 3.90	NB	
3	Trades Helper (assigned as addition to Crew)	10.0%				
a.	"Straight Time", M-F, 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.	9.0%	\$ 46.00	\$ 4.14	NB	
b.	"Premium Time", M-F, 5:01 p.m. to 6:59 a.m.; Weekends and Holidays	1.0%	\$ 60.00	\$ 0.60	NB	
AWARD TOTAL:			\$ 99.90		NO BID	

Lot C: Automated Logic Controls Certified

#	Personnel Classification	WF	WW Gay Mechanical Contractors, Inc.		Automated Controls, LLC	
			Hourly Service Rate	Weighted HR	Hourly Service Rate	Weighted HR
1	HVAC Control System Service Technician (Manufacturer Certification Required) (assigned alone or additional to Crew)	65.0%				
a.	"Straight Time", M-F, 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.	62.0%	NB		\$ 105.00	\$ 65.10
b.	"Premium Time", M-F, 5:01 p.m. to 6:59 a.m.; Weekends and Holidays	3.0%	NB		\$ 125.00	\$ 3.75
2	Electrical Technician w/Limited Energy Contractor License (assigned alone or additional to Crew)	25.0%				
a.	"Straight Time", M-F, 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.	22.0%	NB		\$ 105.00	\$ 23.10
b.	"Premium Time", M-F, 5:01 p.m. to 6:59 a.m.; Weekends and Holidays	3.0%	NB		\$ 125.00	\$ 3.75
3	Trades Helper (assigned as addition to Crew)	10.0%				
a.	"Straight Time", M-F, 7:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.	9.0%	NB		\$ 52.00	\$ 4.68
b.	"Premium Time", M-F, 5:01 p.m. to 6:59 a.m.; Weekends and Holidays	1.0%	NB		\$ 70.00	\$ 0.70
AWARD TOTAL:			NO BID		\$ 101.08	

Number of Bidders Solicited: 31
 Number of Bids Received: 2
 Number of "No Bid" Received: 0

COMMENTS:

Bid Recommendation

At the next regularly scheduled meeting of the School Board of Alachua County, Florida, the Purchasing Department shall recommend that an annual contract for the provision of HVAC control systems installation & maintenance services be awarded to the following the low, responsive and responsible Bidders:

- Lot Bidder**
 A WW Gay Mechanical Contractors, Inc.
 B WW Gay Mechanical Contractors, Inc.
 C Automated Controls, LLC

Tabulated By:  Reviewed By: 

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in F.S. 120.54(3) shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.